H-GAC 'FORM D' - PRODUCT ITEM BASE OFFERING PRICES Procurement No. FS12-19

Offeror Name: Kovatch Mobile Equipment Corp T/A KME Fire Apparatus

Invitation No.: FS12-19 - Fire Service Apparatus (All Types)

Note: All products listed below are to be considered as base model/units for purposes of this Invitation and any subsequent contract.
The Bidder shall determine which Product Codes to bid and shall fill in a bid price in the appropriate cell. Bidder may then bid
upgrades or downgrades to different product codes as options on Form E, with pricing equal to the differential amount between the
base Product Item price and the upgrade or downgrade being offered. Bidders are to provide pricing for options and accessories as
explained in Sections A and B, as well as specific apparatus variations as listed below:

1. Other available Cab/Chassis manufacturer choices for apparatus built on a commercial cab/chassis.

. Different available cab designs (2/4 Door/Tilt Cab etc.)

. Cab/Body sheet and structural metal choices (Galvanneal, Formed/Extruded Aluminum, Stainless Steel)

. Available rear axle configurations (Single/Tandem/Tandem Front Steering/Triple Rear)

. Different fire pumps and mounting locations (1250/1500/2500 GPM Pump/Rear and Mid-Mounted)

. Various body configurations (Walk-In/Non-Walk-In Body) for Rescue, Re-Hab, Hazmat, Mobile Command Centers

2
3
4
5
6
7

. Aerial Categories (Construction/Turntable Positions/Aerial Device Functions)

IMPORTANT: Bidder MUST submit copies of the following with their bid:

(1) A copy of each participating bidder/dealer's TxXMVD dealer license identifying the make/brand of apparatus being bid.

(2) An originally signed Form A from the all entities who are party to this submission and who should be offered a contract if this
submission is successful. These entities should include the Apparatus Manufacturer, Eranchised Texas Dealer and those
dealers outside Texas who have current or past sales through the program (Note: All other sales outside Texas should be
coordinated through the manufacturer when possible). In those cases where sales must go through a dealer due to franchise

agreements, Form A's will be accepted from those dealers. For those only bidding conversions (i.e. brush trucks, light
rescues), Form A's from in-state commercial chassis dealers for the underlying chassis make being quoted should be provided.

(3) A copy of the bidders and/or manufacturers's Texas Motor Vehicle Converter license (where applicable).

Note: The above requirements must be met prior to any contracts being issued.

Product Model & Description . Base Offered
Code (Note: Bid only the base Item/Model on this Form . No changes/modifications to Price

Form D descriptions will be accepted and will result in bid item being deemed
non-compliant. Bid available options noted above on Form E)

0. KME

A. Aerials (Booms/Platforms, Ladders, Ladder/Platforms)

FS190A01 KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 79'| ~ $745,748.00
500# Rear Mounted Telescoping Steel Ladder

FS190A02 KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, $883,854.00
103", 4 Section, 500# Rear Mounted Telescoping Steel Ladder

FS190A03 KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, $830,871.00
79' 750# Rear Mounted Telescoping Steel Ladder

FS190A04 KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, $992,522.00
123' 500# Rear Mounted Telescoping Steel Ladder

FS190A05 KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, $1,030,950.00
102' 1000# Rear Mounted Telescoping Ladder with Platform
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FS190A06 KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, $1,083,101.00
100' 1000# Mid-Mounted Telescoping Ladder with Platform

FS190A07 KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Single Axle, No Bid
100' 500# (Mid-Mount), Telescoping Steel Ladder

FS190A08 KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 55' No Bid
Water Tower (FireStix)

FS190A09 International 4400, 4-Door, Formed Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 55' Water No Bid
Tower (FireStix)

FS190A10 KME, 4-Door Full-Tilt Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum Body, Tractor Drawn $1,134,345.00

Aerial (TDA), 100', 4 Section 500# Steel Telescoping Ladder

B. Wildland Fire Apparatus (Brush Fire)

FS190B01 181,851.00
Ford F-550, 4 x 4, 2-Door, Skid Mounted Pumper Body

FS190B02 160,720.00
Ford F-550, 4 x 4, 2-Door, Flatbed Style Skid Mounted Pumper

FS190B03 Ford F-550, 4 x 4, 2-Door, Aluminum Minipumper Body, 300 gal. Tank, 1000 221,002.00
gpm Midship PTO Pump

FS190B04 International 7400, 4x4, 4-Door, Ridgerunner, Dual Pump, 500/20 Gals 365,090.00
Water/Foam, NFPA 1901/1906

FS190B05 International 7400, 4 x 4, 4-Door, OEM Interface Pumper, Formed Alum Body, 266,706.00
Single Axle, 750 GPM, 500 Gallon Water

C. Pumper Fire Apparatus

FS190C01 Freightliner M2, 2-Door, OEM Pumper, Formed Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 280,034.00
1250 GPM Pump, 750 Gal Tank-Challenger Series Pumper

FS190C02 International 4400, 2-Door, OEM Pumper, Formed Aluminum Body, Single 278,855.00
Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, 750 Gal Tank-Pumper

FS190C03 KME Panther Chassis, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, Aluminum Cab, Formed Aluminum 412,108.00
Body, Single Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, 750 Gal Tank-Pumper

FS190C04 KME Predator Chassis, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, Aluminum Cab, Alum Body, Single 425,029.00
Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, Pumper

FS190C05 KME Severe Service Chassis, 4-Door, Full-Title, Aluminum Cab, Alum Body, 428,982.00

Single Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, 750 Gal Tank Pumper

D. Special Service Apparatus (Walk-In & Non-Walk-in Bodies) Multi-use: Rescue, Re-Hab, Hazmat,
Mobile Command Center
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FS190D01 $ 158,151.00
Ford F-550 4 x 2 Chassis, 2 Door, Light Duty Walk-Around Body

FS190D02 No Bid
Intl 4300, 4 x 2, 2-Door, Medium Duty Walk-Around Body

FS190D03 No Bid
International 4400, 4 x 2, 2-Door, Medium Duty Walk-In Body

FS190D04 KME Predator Chasis, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, Aluminum Cab, Alum Body, Single $ 377,072.00
Axle, Heavy Duty Walk-Around Body

FS190D05 KME Custom, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, Aluminum Cab, Alum Body, Single Axle, Heavy| $ 418,556.00
Duty Combination Walk-in / Walk-Around Body

FS190D06 $ 291,235.00
International 4400 4x2, 2-Door, 10 person Crew Carrier

E. Pumper/Tankers & Tankers

FS190E01 International 4400, 2-Door, Aluminum Treadplate Body, Single Axle, 1250 GPM | $ 234,734.00
Pump, Painted 1800 Gal Elliptical Tanker

FS190E02 International 7400, 2-Door, Aluminum Treadplate Body, Tandem Axle, 1250 $ 270,734.00
GPM Pump, Painted 2500 Gal Elliptical Tanker

FS190E03 International 4400, 2-Door, Aluminum Treadplate Body, Single Axle, 500 GPM | $ 230,164.00
Pump, Painted 1800 Gal Wetside Tanker

FS190E04 International 7400, 2-Door, Aluminum Treadplate Body, Tandem Axle, 500 GPM | $ 274,428.00
Pump, Painted 2500 Gal Wetside Tanker

FS190E05 International 4400, 2-Door, Formed Galvanneal Body, Single Axle, 750 GPM $ 271,832.00
Pump, 1800 Gal Dryside Tanker

FS190E06 International 7400, 2-Door, Formed Galvanneal Body, Tandem Axle, 750 GPM $ 308,365.00
Pump, 3000 Gal Dryside Tanker

FS190E07 International 4400, 2-Door, Formed Galvanneal Body, Single Axle, 1250 GPM $ 271,164.00
Pump, 1800 Gal Pumper/Tanker

FS190E08 International 7400, 2-Door, Formed Galvanneal Body, Tandem Axle, 1250 GPM | $ 294,353.00
Pump, 2500 Gal Pumper/Tanker

FS190E09 KME Predator, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, Aluminum Cab, Alum Body, Tandem Axle, $ 456,314.00
3,000 Gallon, Pumper-Tanker with 1250gpm Pump

F. Airport Rescue Fire-Fighting Vehicles
FS190F01 $ 271,690.00

Ford F550, 4 x 4, 4-Door, Class 1 RIV, 120 GAL AFFF Pre-mix
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FS190F02 Ford F550, 4 x 4, 4-Door, Class 2 RIV, 500 GPM Pump, 300/40 Gal Water/Foam | $ 275,844.00
Tank

FS190F03 International 7400 4 x 4, 2-Door, Class 3 RIV, 500 GPM Pump, 500/75 Gal $ 360,641.00
Water/Foam Tank

FS190F04 No Bid
KME Custom Class 4 ARFF, 4 x 4, 2000 GPM, 1500/200 Gal Water/Foam Tank

FS190F05 No Bid

KME Custom Class 5 ARFF, 6 x 6, 2000 GPM, 3000/400 Gal Water/Foam Tank
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