L. Ferrara

A. Aerials (Booms/Platforms, Ladders, Ladder/Platforms)

Cinder, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 57" Rear Mounted

FS19LA01 Telescoping Ladder $718,277.00
Igniter, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 57' Rear Mounted

FS19LA02 Telescoping Ladder $734,471.00
Inferno, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 57' Rear Mounted

FS19LA03 Telescoping Ladder $756,720.00
Cinder, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 77' Rear Mounted

FS19LA04 Telescoping Ladder $791,977.00
Igniter, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 77' Rear Mounted

FS19LA05 Telescoping Ladder $807,071.00
Inferno, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 77' Rear Mounted

FS19LA06 Telescoping Ladder $830,420.00
Inferno, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 107' Rear Mounted

FS19LA07 Telescoping Ladder $969,113.00
Inferno, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 127' Rear Mounted

FS19LA08 Telescoping Ladder NO BID
Inferno, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 100" Mid-Mounted

FS19LA09 Telescoping Ladder NO BID
Inferno, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 85' Mid-Mounted

FS19LA10 Telescoping Ladder with Platform NO BID
Inferno, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 85' Rear Mounted

FSI9LAIL Telescoping Ladder with Platform NO BID
Inferno, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 100' Rear Mounted

FS19LAI2 Telescoping Ladder with Platform $1,105,670.00
Inferno, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 100" Mid-Mounted

FS19LAI3 Telescoping Ladder with Platform $1,293,858.00

FS191LA14 Inferno, 4-Door Full-Tilt OEM Cab, Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 100' Tractor Drawn Ladder | $1,192,310.00

B. Wildland Fire Apparatus (Brush Fire)

FS19LB01 Self-Contained Slip-In Unit NO BID

FS19LB02 Ferrara Brush Fire Apparatus, Ford Truck, Extruded Aluminum Flatbed NO BID

FS19LB03 Ferrara Brush Fire Apparatus, Dodge Truck, Extruded Aluminum Flatbed NO BID

C. Pumper Fire Apparatus

Freightliner M2, 2-Door, Extruded Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, Mid-

FS19LCo01 Mounted Pumper $282,363.00
Freightliner M2, 4-Door, Extruded Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, Mid-

FS19L.C02 Mounted Pumper $297,007.00
Custom Cinder, 4-Door, Full-Tilt Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 1500 GPM Pump,

FS19LC03 Mid-Mounted Pumper $431,615.00
Custom Igniter, 4-Door, Full-Tilt Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 1500 GPM Pump,

FS19L.C04 Mid-Mounted Pumper $445,942.00

FS19LCO5 Custom Inferno, 4-Door, Full-Tilt Cab, Extruded Aluminum Body, Single Axle, 1500 GPM Pump, $469.883.00

Mid-Mounted Pumper

D. Special Service Ap

paratus (Walk-In & Non-Walk-in Bodies) Multi-use: Rescue, Re-Hab, Hazmat, Mobile

FS19LDO01 Ford 550, 2-door Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, NON-Walk-In LIGHT Rescue $160,180.00

FS19LD02 Ford 550, 2-door Super Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, NON-Walk-In LIGHT $162 738.00
Rescue ’

FS19LD03 Ford 550, 4-door Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, NON-Walk-In LIGHT Rescue $167,270.00
Freightliner M2, 2-door Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, NON-Walk-In MEDIUM

FS19LD04 R £ Y $200,989.00
Freightliner M2, 4-door Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, NON-Walk-In MEDIUM

FS19LD05 R £ Y $215,625.00

escue

FS19LD06 Freightliner M2, 2-door Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, Walk-In MEDIUM Rescue | $227,226.00

FS19LD07 Freightliner M2, 4-door Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, Walk-In MEDIUM Rescue | $242.,239.00
Cinder, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, OEM Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, NON Walk-In

FS19LD0S HEAVY Rescue $363,372.00
Cinder, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, OEM Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, Walk-In HEAVY

FS19LD09 s Y $406,800.00

Rescue
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Igniter, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, OEM Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, NON Walk-In

FS19LD10 HEAVY Rescue $378,467.00
Igniter, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, OEM Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, Walk-In HEAVY

FS19LD11 R ¢ g $421,895.00
Inferno, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, OEM Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, NON Walk-In

FS19LD12 HEAVY Rescue $402,407.00
Inferno, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, OEM Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, Walk-In HEAVY

FSIOLDI3  [po ¢ g $445,836.00
Inferno, 4-Door, Full-Tilt, OEM Cab, Single Axle, Extruded Aluminum Body, Incident Command

FS19LD14 . NO BID
Vehicle

E. Pumper/Tankers & Tankers

M2 Freightliner, 2-Door, Extruded Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, Mid-

FSI9LE(1 Mounted Pumper/Tanker (3000 Gallons) $345,300.00
M2 Freightliner, 4-Door, Extruded Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, Mid-

FSI19LE02 Mounted Pumper/Tanker (3000 Gallons) $359’691‘00
Custom Cinder 2, 4-Door, Extruded Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, Mid-

FS19LE03 Mounted Pumper/Tanker (3000 Gallons) $505,225.00
Custom Igniter, 4-Door, Extruded Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, Mid-

FS19LE04 Mounted Pumper/Tanker (3000 Gallons) $520’320‘00
Custom Inferno, 4-Door, Extruded Aluminum Body, Tandem Axle, 1250 GPM Pump, Mid-

FS19LE0S Y P $543,669.00

Mounted Pumper/Tanker (3000 Gallons)
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