FORM-D: PRODUCT ITEM BASE OFFERING PRICES Invitation No.: BS08-19
Offeror
Name: | Creative Bus Sales, Inc.
Where avaialable, offeror shall include alternative fuel options with the Form-E options document (factory or aftermarket
retrofits)
Base
H-GAC Base Bid Item Description Offered
Product . . . c
Code (Offeror may not change any item description.) Price, in
‘Whole Dollars
A : Bluebird
AA1 |Micro Bird G5: 14 pass / GM 6.0L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 139" WB, min.
AA2 |Micro Bird G5: 29 pass / GM 6.0L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 159” WB, min.
AA3  [Micro Bird G5: 34 pass / GM 6.0L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 176" WB, min.
AA4 |Micro Bird MBII: 14 pass / Ford T-Series 3.7L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 156” WB, min.
AAS5 |Micro Bird MBII: 24 pass / Ford T-Series 3.7L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 156” WB, min.
AA6  [Micro Bird G5 MFSAB: 14 pass / GM 6.0L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 139" WB min
AA7  [Micro Bird G5 MFSAB: 20 pass / GM 6.0L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 159" WB min
AA8 |Micro Bird MBIl MFSAB: 14 pass / Ford T-Series 3.7L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 138” WB, min.
AA9 |Micro Bird MBIl MFSAB: 20 pass / Ford T-Series 3.7L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 156” WB, min.
CA1 |Vision: 47 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 LPG / Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA2 |Vision: 53 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 LPG / Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA3 |Vision: 59 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 LPG / Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA4 |Vision: 65 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 LPG / Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CAS5 |Vision: 71 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 LPG / Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA6 |Vision: 77 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 LPG / Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA7 |Vision: 78 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 LPG / Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA8 | Vision: 47 pass / Blue Bird / Ford VV-10 Gasoline/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA9 |Vision: 53 pass / Blue Bird / Ford VV-10 Gasoline/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA10 |Vision: 59 pass / Blue Bird / Ford VV-10 Gasoline/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA11 |Vision: 65 pass / Blue Bird / Ford VV-10 Gasoline/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA12 |Vision: 71 pass / Blue Bird / Ford VV-10 Gasoline/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA13 |Vision: 77 pass / Blue Bird / Ford VV-10 Gasoline/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA14 |Vision: 78 pass / Blue Bird / Ford VV-10 Gasoline/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA15 |Vision: 47 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 CNG/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA16 |Vision: 53 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 CNG/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA17 |Vision: 59 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 CNG/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA18 |Vision: 65 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 CNG/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA19 |Vision: 71 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 CNG/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA20 |Vision: 77 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 CNG/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA21 |Vision: 78 pass / Blue Bird / Ford V-10 CNG/Ford 6R140 Transmission 6-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA22 |Vision: 71 pass / Blue Bird / Electric / 189" WB
CA23 |Vision: 77 pass / Blue Bird / Electric / 189" WB
CA24 |Vision: 35 pass / Blue Bird / Cummins, 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 169” WB
CA25 |Vision: 47 pass / Blue Bird / Cummins, 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 189” WB
CA26 |Vision: 53 pass / Blue Bird / Cummins, 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 2177 WB
CA27 |Vision: 59 pass / Blue Bird / Cummins, 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 238” WB
CA28 |Vision: 65 pass / Blue Bird / Cummins, 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 252” WB
CA29 |Vision: 71 pass / Blue Bird / Cummins, 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto/ 273” WB
CA30 |Vision: 77 pass / Blue Bird / Cummins, 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto/ 273” WB
CA31 |Vision: 78 pass / Blue Bird / Cummins, 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto/ 280" WB
DA1 |T3FE: 54 pass / Bluebird / Cummins, 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 141” WB
DA2 |T3FE: 60 pass / Bluebird / Cummins, 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 169” WB
DA3 |T3FE: 66 pass / Bluebird / Cummins, 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 190” WB
DA4 |T3FE: 72 pass / Bluebird / Cummins, 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 190” WB
DAS5 |T3FE: 78 pass / Bluebird / Cummins, 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 211” WB
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DA6 | T3FE: 84 pass / Bluebird / Cummins, 220 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 232” WB
DA7 |T3RE: 63 pass/ Bluebird / CNG / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 189” WB
DA8 |T3RE: 72 pass / Bluebird / CNG 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 217" WB
DA9 |T3RE: 78 pass / Bluebird / CNG 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 245” WB
DA10 |T3RE: 84 pass / Bluebird / CNG 220 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 273” WB
DAI11 [T3RE: 63 pass / Bluebird / Cummins 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 189” WB
DA12 |T3RE: 72 pass / Bluebird / Cummins 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 2177 WB
DAI13 [T3RE: 78 pass / Bluebird / Cummins 200 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 245” WB
DA14 [T3RE: 84 pass / Bluebird / Cummins 220 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 273” WB
DA15 |T3RE: 78 pass / Bluebird / Electric / 245" WB
DA16 |T3RE: 84 pass/ Bluebird / Electric / 273" WB
B. Collins
AB1 |DH400: 14 pass / GM 6.0L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 139” WB, min.
AB2 |DH416: 24 pass / GM 6.0L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 139” WB, min.
AB3 |DH500: 29 pass / GM 6.0L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 159” WB, min.
AB4 |DH516: 33 pass / GM 6.0L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 159" WB, min.
AB5 |DH400 MFSAB: 14 pass/ GM 6.0L Gas/ 6-Sp auto/ 139" WB. min.
AB6 |DH416 MFSAB: 16 pass/ GM 6.0L Gas/ 6-Sp auto/ 139" WB. min.
AB7 |DH500 MFSAB: 30 pass/ GM 6.0L Gas/ 6-Sp auto/ 159" WB. min.
AB8 |DH516 MFSAB: 33 pass/ GM 6.0L Gas/ 6-Sp auto/ 159" WB. min.
AB9 |TH500: 14 pass /Ford Transit 3.7L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 156” WB, min.
AB10 [TH500: 25 pass /Ford Transit 3.7L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 156” WB, min.
ABI11 [TH400 MFSAB: 14 pass /Ford Transit 3.7L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 138” WB, min.
AB12 [TH500 MFSAB: 20 pass / T-Series 3.7L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 156” WB, min.
C. GreenPower
DC1 |Synapse 32: 54 pass / purpose built chassis / TM4 electric, direct-drive / 255” WB $532.053.00
DC2 |Synapse 72: 72 pass / purpose built chassis / TM4 electric, direct-drive / 208” WB $482.503.00
DC3  |Synapse 90: 90 pass / purpose built chassis / TM4 electric, direct-drive / 255” WB $557,053.00
D. International
CD1 |CE-18: 35 pass / International / 200 Hp Diesel / 265Hp Gas / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 158” WB
CE-23: 47 pass / International / 200 Hp Diesel / 265Hp Gas & Propane / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto /
CD2
193" WB
CE-25: 53 pass / International / 200 Hp Diesel / 265Hp Gas & Propane / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto /
CD3 .
218" WB
CD4 |CE-28: 59 pass / International / 200 Hp Diesel / 265Hp Gas / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 236" WB
CD5 |CE-30: 65 pass / International / 200 Hp Diesel / 265Hp Gas / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 236" WB
CE-31: 71 pass (short WB)/ Intl / 200 Hp Diesel / 265Hp Gas & Propane / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp
CD6 N
auto/ 254” WB
CE-32: 71 pass (long WB)/ Intl / 200 Hp Diesel / 265Hp Gas & Propane / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp
CD7 .
auto/ 276“ WB
CD8 |CE-34: 77 pass / Intl 200 Hp D/ 265Hp Gas & Propane / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto/ 276” WB
DDI1 |RE-37: 78 pass / International / 240 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 249” WB
DD2 |RE-39: 84 pass / International / 240 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 276” WB
DD3 |RE-39: 90 pass / International / 240 Hp / Allison 2500 PTS 5-Sp auto / 303” WB
E. Thomas Built
AF1 Minotour: 14 pass / GMC-Chev 6.0L gasoline / 6-Sp auto / 139” WB, min.
AF2  |Minotour: 23 pass / GMC-Chev 6.0L gasoline / 6-Sp auto / 139” WB, min.
AF3  |Minotour: 14 pass/ GMC-Chev 6.0L gasoline / 6-Sp auto / 159” WB, min.
AF4  |Minotour: 29 pass / GMC-Chev 6.0L gasoline / 6-Sp auto / 159” WB, min.
CF1 |C2: 36 pass / Freightliner / 200 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto/ 158” WB
CF2 |C2: 42 pass / Freightliner / 200 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto/ 179” WB
CF3 |C2: 48 pass / Freightliner / 200 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto/ 199” WB
CF4  |C2: 54 pass / Freightliner / 200 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto/ 219” WB
CF5 |C2: 54 pass / Freightliner / PSI 270 Hp Propane / Allison 2550 PTS 6-Sp auto /219" WB
CF6  |C2: 54 pass / Freightliner / Agility 339 Hp Propane / Allison 2300 PTS 6-Sp auto / 219" WB
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CF7  |C2: 54 pass / Freightliner / 200 Hp CNG / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 219" WB

CF8 |C2: 60 pass / Freightliner / 200 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto/ 238” WB

CF9 |C2: 60 pass / Freightliner / PSI 270 Hp Propane / Allison 2550 PTS 6-Sp auto / 238" WB

CF10 |C2: 60 pass / Freightliner / Agility 339 Hp Propane / Allison 2300 PTS 6-Sp auto / 238" WB

CF11 |C2: 60 pass / Freightliner / 200 Hp CNG / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 238" WB

CF12 |C2: 72 pass / Freightliner / 200 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto/ 259” WB

CF13 |C2: 72 pass/ Freightliner / PS1 270 Hp Propane / Allison 2550 PTS 6-Sp auto / 259" WB

CF14 |C2: 72 pass / Freightliner / Agility 339 Hp Propane / Allison 2300 PTS 6-Sp auto / 259" WB

CF15 |C2: 72 pass / Freightliner / 200 Hp CNG / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 259" WB

CF16 |C2: 78 pass / Freightliner / 200 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto/ 279” WB

CF17 |C2: 78 pass/ Freightliner / PS1 270 Hp Propane / Allison 2550 PTS 6-Sp auto / 279" WB

CF18 |C2: 78 pass / Freightliner / Agility 339 Hp Propane / Allison 2300 PTS 6-Sp auto / 279" WB

CF19 |C2: 78 pass / Freightliner / 200 Hp CNG / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 279" WB

DF1 |EFX: 53pass/ Thomas / 200 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 136” WB

DF2 |EFX: 59 pass / Thomas / 200 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 155” WB

DF3 |EFX: 65 pass / Thomas / 200 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 174” WB

DF4 |EFX: 71 pass / Thomas / 200 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 193” WB

DF5 |EFX: 77 pass / Thomas / 200Hp Diesel/ Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 212” WB

DF6 |EFX: 83 pass / Thomas / 220 Hp Diesel/ Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 231” WB

DF7 |HDX: 60 pass / Thomas / 220 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 181” WB

DF8 |HDX: 60 pass / Thomas / 250 Hp CNG / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 181" WB

DF9 |HDX: 66 pass / Thomas / 220 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 209” WB

DF10 [HDX: 66 pass / Thomas /250 Hp CNG / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 209" WB

DF11 |HDX: 72 pass / Thomas / 220 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 238” WB

DF12 [HDX: 72 pass / Thomas / 250 Hp CNG / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 238" WB

DF13 |HDX: 78 pass / Thomas / 220 Hp Diesel / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 267” WB

DF14 [HDX: 78 pass / Thomas / 250 Hp CNG / Allison 2500 PTS 6-Sp auto / 267" WB

DF15 |HDX: 84 pass / Thomas / 240 Hp Diesel / Allison 3000 PTS 6-Sp auto / 277” WB

DF16 [HDX: 84 pass/ Thomas /250 Hp CNG / Allison 3000 PTS 6-Sp auto / 277" WB

F. Starcraft

AF1  |Quest SRW: 14 passenger/Ford Transit/ 3.7L V6/6 spd-auto/9000 GVWR/138" $55.609.00
AF2  |Quest SRW: 16 passenger/Ford Transit/ 3.7L V6/6 spd-auto/9000 GVWR/138" $56.055.00
AF3  |Quest SRW: 20 passenger/Ford Transit/ 3.7L V6/6 spd-auto/9500 GVWR/158" No Bid

AF4  |Quest DRW: 14 pass/ GM 6.0L Gas/ 6-Sp auto / 139" WB $57.,936.00
AF5 Quest DRW: 14 pass/ Ford 5.4L Gas/ 5-Sp auto / 138" WB $58.829.00
AF6  |Quest DRW: 20 pass/ GM 6.0L Gas/ 6-Sp auto / 139" WB $58.804.00
AF7  |Quest DRW: 20 pass/ Ford 5.4L Gas/ 6-Sp auto / 138" WB $59.,697.00
AF8  |Quest DRW: 24 pass/ GM 6.0L Gas/ 6-Sp auto / 159" WB $60,397.00
AF9 Quest DRW: 24 pass/ Ford 5.4L Gas/ 5-Sp auto / 158" WB $61.072.00
AF10 |Quest DRW: 29 pass/ GM 6.0L Gas/ 6-Sp auto / 159" WB $62,588.00
AF11 [Quest DRW: 30 pass/ Ford 5.4L Gas/ 5-Sp auto / 159" WB $65.585.00
AF12  [Quest DRW: 34 pass/ GM 6.0L Gas/ 6-Sp auto / 159" WB No Bid
AF13  [Quest DRW: 20 passenger/Ford Transit/ 3.7L V6/6 spd-auto/10360 GVWR/138" $59.256.00
AF14  |Quest DRW: 23 passenger/Ford Transit/ 3.7L V6/6 spd-auto/10360 GVWR/158" No Bid
AF15  |Quest: 18 pass / E450 Cutaway / Electric / 158" WB $236.252.00
AF16  |Prodigy DRW MFSAB: 14 pass/GM 6.0L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 139" WB $56.058.00
AF17 [Prodigy DRW MFSAB: 14 pass/ Ford 5.4L Gas/ 5-Sp auto / 138" WB $56.734.00
AF18 |Prodigy DRW MFSAB: 20 pass/GM 6.0L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 139" WB $56.926.00
AF19  [Prodigy DRW MFSAB: 20 pass/ Ford 5.4L Gas/ 6-Sp auto / 138" WB $57,602.00
AF20 [Prodigy DRW MFSAB: 24 pass/GM 6.0L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 159" WB $59.060.00
AF21 |Prodigy DRW MFSAB: 24 pass/ Ford 5.4L Gas/ 5-Sp auto / 158" WB $59,090.00
AF22  [Prodigy DRW MFSAB: 29 pass/GM 6.0L Gas / 6-Sp auto / 159" WB $62,344.00
AF23  |Prodigy DRW MFSAB: 30 pass/ Ford 5.4L Gas/ 5-Sp auto / 159" WB $65,243.00
AF24  |Prodigy DRW MFSAB: 34 pass/ GM 6.0L Gas/ 6-Sp auto / 159" WB No Bid
AF25 |Prodigy DRW: 20 passenger/Ford Transit/ 3.7L V6/6 spd-auto/10360 GVWR/138" WB $57.137.00
AF26  |Prodigy DRW: 23 passenger/Ford Transit/ 3.7L V6/6 spd-auto/10360 GVWR/158" WB No Bid
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BF1

Quest XL: 48 pass/Ford F59 /6.8L Gas/6-Sp Auto/ 208" WB

$114,991.00

Quest XL: 45 Pass / Ford F59 chassis /Ford V10 / CNG (Landi Renzo System conversion) / 6-sp auto

BE2 1508 wa $148,900.00
BF3 Quest XL: Starcraft F59, 45 pass / Electric (Motiv System drivetrain) / 208" WB $329.372.00
BF4  [Prodigy XL MFSAB: 48 pass/Ford F59 6.8L Gas/6-Sp Auto/ 208" WB $112,890.00
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